
B.Com (Bachelor of Commerce) 

▶ Program Outcomes (POs): 

 PO1: Develop soft skills for effective communication and work efficiency. 

 PO2: Leadership development and management skills. 

 PO3: Innovativeness and entrepreneurship for solving business issues. 

 PO4: Ethical standards in life and business practices. 

 PO5: Adaptability to changing environments. 

 PO6: Research and analytical abilities for emerging issues. 

 PO7: Practical exposure for employability. 

 PO8: Environmental consciousness. 

▶ Program Specific Outcomes (PSOs): 

 PSO1: Understand management and quantitative techniques. 

 PSO2: Apply management principles in business. 

 PSO3: Use management knowledge for entrepreneurship. 

 PSO4: Gain skills in practical applications like digital marketing and logistics. 

B.A. in Public Administration/ Political Science 

▶ Program Outcomes (POs): 

 PO1: Detailed knowledge in humanities and social sciences. 

 PO2: Analytical skills to resolve complex social issues. 

 PO3: Understand concepts outside core disciplines. 

 PO4: Independent knowledge acquisition with appropriate theories. 

 PO5: Link knowledge to social, historical, and cultural contexts. 

 PO6: Effective communication skills. 

 PO7: Act as critically discerning participants in society. 

 PO8: Self-reflection and creativity for personal and professional goals. 

▶ Program Specific Outcomes (PSOs): 

 PSO1: Critical analysis of political phenomena. 

 PSO2: Understanding political events and processes with remedial suggestions. 

 PSO3: Sensitivity to social and political issues. 

 PSO4: Theoretical understanding for political analysis. 

 



B.A. in Economics 

▶ Program Outcomes (POs): 

 PO1: Theoretical and practical knowledge about economic behavior, institutions, and 
policies. 

 PO2: Critical thinking for economic phenomena. 

 PO3: Awareness of ethical business practices and ecological concerns. 

 PO4: Understanding of economic rationality and communication skills. 

 PO5: Preparation for careers in teaching, industry, government, or self-employment. 

 PO6: Awareness of sustainable use of natural resources. 

▶ Program Specific Outcomes (PSOs): 

 PSO1: Knowledge of economic processes at micro and macro levels. 

 PSO2: Critical thinking linked to decision-making in economic planning and policies. 

 PSO3: Application of economic analysis principles. 

 PSO4: Effective writing, reporting, and presentation. 

B.A. English 

▶ Program Outcomes (POs): 

 PO 1: Demonstrate a detailed knowledge and understanding of selected fields of study in 
core disciplines in the humanities, social sciences and languages. 

 PO 2: Apply critical and analytical skills and methods to the identification and resolution 
of problems within complex changing social contexts. 

 PO 3: Demonstrate a general understanding of the concepts and principles of selected 
areas of study outside core disciplines of the humanities, social sciences and languages. 

 PO 4: Apply an independent approach to knowledge that uses rigorous methods of 
inquiry and appropriate theories. 

 PO 5: Articulate the relationship between diverse forms of knowledge and the social, 
historical and cultural contexts that produced them. 

 PO 6: Communicate effectively and show ability to read, write, listen to and speak in a 
chosen language/s with fluency. 

 PO 7: Act as informed and critically discerning participants within the community of 
scholars, as citizens and in the work force.  

 PO 8: Work with independence, self-reflection and creativity to meet goals and 
challenges in the workplace and personal life. 



▶ Program Specific Outcomes (PSOs): 

 PSO1: Create social awareness with regard to society and culture. 

 PSO2: Communicate in English language with proper knowledge of the language. 

 PSO3: Evaluate teaching learning process through various teaching aids. 

 PSO4: Respond to the fecundity of imagination and verisimilitude of life which 
constitute the cognitive and rational response to society. 

B.A. (Hindi) 

▶ Program Outcomes (POs): 

 PO 1: Demonstrate a detailed knowledge and understanding of selected fields of study in 
core disciplines in the humanities, social sciences and languages. 

 PO 2: Apply critical and analytical skills and methods to the identification and resolution 
of problems within complex changing social contexts.  

 PO 3: Demonstrate a general understanding of the concepts and principles of selected 
areas of study outside core disciplines of the humanities, social sciences and languages.  

 PO 4: Apply an independent approach to knowledge that uses rigorous methods of 
inquiry and appropriate theories.  

 PO 5: Articulate the relationship between diverse forms of knowledge and the social, 
historical and cultural contexts that produced them.  

 PO 6: Communicate effectively and show ability to read, write, listen to and speak in a 
chosen language/s with fluency.  

 PO 7: Act as informed and critically discerning participants within the community of 
scholars, as citizens and in the work force.  

 PO 8: Work with independence, self-reflection and creativity to meet goals and 
challenges in the workplace and personal life. 

▶ Program Specific Outcomes (PSOs): 

 PSO1: ѳावसाियक ˘े̷  मЋ भाषा का िवशषेकर दी भाषा का सी ̼योग कर सकेगा। दसूरी भाषा के िवकास के मा˴यम स े

भाषा के सां̂कृितक म ू˽ यЗ तथा उसके िवरासत की दशाХ का बोध होगा। 

 PSO2: समकालीन सािह˱य के िविभ˵न गѧϽपЗ के मा˴यम स ेयगु का बोध होगा। सािह˱य की िविभ˵न िवधाХ मЋ 

रचना˱मक लखेन एव ंसं̼ षेण की ˘मता िवकिसत होगी। 

 PSO3: सािह˱य ससंार, वा̂तपु҄रक ससंार के यथाथ ̊के ̼ित आलोचना˱मक समझ िवकिसत होगी। सािह˱य के सКदय,̊ 

कला तथा च҄र̷ िवकास की म ू˽ यЗ के ̼ित जागϽकता होगी। 

 PSO4: ѳҚл˱व िवकास हते ुभाषायी कौशल, कं˶यटूर, िववाद, ̼̂तिुत कौशल, िचतंनशҚл, िच̷मचं आिद के बारे मЋ 

सјैांितक ѳावहा҄रक ˙ान होगा। 



B.A. Geography 

▶ Program Outcomes (POs): 

 PO 1: Demonstrate comprehensive disciplinary knowledge gained during course of study. 

 PO 1: Ability to communicate effectively on general and scientific topics with the 
scientific community and with society at large. 

 PO 1: Capability of applying knowledge to solve scientific and other problems. 

 PO 1: Capable to learn and work effectively as an individual, and as a member or leader 
in diverse teams, in multidisciplinary settings. 

 PO 1: Ability of critical thinking, analytical reasoning and research-based knowledge 
including design of experiments, analysis and interpretation of data to provide 
conclusions. 

 PO 1: Ability to use and learn techniques, skills and modern tools for scientific practices. 

 PO 1: Ability to apply reasoning to assess the different issues related to society and the 
consequent responsibilities relevant to the professional scientific practices. 

 PO 1: Aptitude to apply knowledge and skills necessary for participating in learning 
activities throughout life. 

 PO 1: Ability to design and develop modern systems which are environmentally sensitive 
and understand the importance of sustainable development. 

 PO 1: Apply ethical principles and professional responsibilities in scientific practices. 

 PO 1: Ability to demonstrate knowledge and understanding of the scientific principles 
and apply these to manage projects. 

▶ Program Specific Outcomes (PSOs): 

 PSO1: Basic understanding of fundamental concepts of geography as an earth science. 
 PSO2: Clearly formulate and solve real-life challenges with respect to human-

environment interactions. 
 PSO3: Applications of fundamental principles of geography for the betterment of human 

society. 
 PSO4: Acquisition of skills to effectively communicate the knowledge of geography to 

the society for safeguarding the physical environment. 

 


